
Three Ireland (Hutchison) Limited/Three Ireland Services (Hutchison) Limited (each 
“Three”) - Three Prepay Weekly Top-up Treats Week 6 (“Competition”)  
 

Competition Dates: 8th August 2022 – 14th August 2022 Inclusive 
 

1. The following terms and conditions are in addition to and form part of the terms and 

conditions of the Three Service (including but not limited to those set out in the 

Terms of Service and in the Price Guide including Prepay terms and conditions of 

service, any Booster terms and the terms and conditions of your Price Plan). In the 

event of any conflict, these terms and conditions shall prevail. 

2. The Competition runs during the Competition Dates set out above  

3. Any instructions provided at the point-of-sale form part of the terms and conditions 

of this Competition and in the event of a conflict, these terms and conditions take 

precedence. 

 

Three Prepay Weekly Top-up Treats Week 6 Competition 

All Three Prepay customers who top-up by a value of €20 or more in one go via any top up 
channel during the Competition Dates (“Eligible Customers”) will be in a chance of winning 
one of 2 €1,000 3Plus International Breaks vouchers (each “The Prize”). Only one entry per 
customer per mobile phone number. Prizes are not transferable and there is no cash or 
other alternative. 

 

2 conditional Prize winners will be randomly selected by Three on 16th August 2022 and 
contacted by SMS on the same date. Winners will be asked for their email address so that 
can be forwarded a link to the voucher and provided with all the necessary details on 
options available to book their International Break.  Winners must provide their address to 
Three by 30th August 2022. If an email address is not provided by 30th August 2022, prize will 
be forfeited and Three will not draw alternative winners. Vouchers will have a validity of 5 
years from redemption date. To be included in the Prize draw, Three Prepay customers 
must be active Three prepay customers on the 16th August 2022 and top up by the value of 
€20 or more during the Competition Dates. Vouchers are subject to Hotelsinone Terms and 
Conditions. It is the responsibility of Prize winners to manage any tax liabilities arising from 
receipt of the Prize. 

 

Each €1,000 voucher is applicable towards the cost of flights and accommodation for 2 
nights for 2 people in selected international destinations and at selected dates, subject to 
availability. Where the amount payable for flights exceeds €250 per person, the amount in 
excess will need to be covered by the winners and will not be covered by the voucher. 

 



Prizes are non-transferable and cannot be exchanged for cash or for any other item. 
Employees of Three Ireland (Hutchison) Limited or Three Ireland Services (Hutchison) 
Limited, or any of their subsidiary companies, their families, agents or anyone else 
connected with this competition are not eligible to take part in this competition.   

 

Three reserves the right to withdraw the Competition either generally or in respect of any 

particular customer at any time and to vary or amend any element of the Competition, 

subject to reasonable notice being provided. Except as clearly stated in this Competition 

terms, all terms, conditions, warranties, and representations (whether written or implied) in 

relation to the provision of the Competition are excluded to the fullest extent allowed. 

 


